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Department of Veterans Affairs § 1.632

where a privately-purchased outer bur-
ial receptacle was used on and after Oc-
tober 9, 1996. For burials on and after 
January 1, 2000, the person identified in 
records contained in the National Cem-
etery Administration Burial Oper-
ations Support System as the person 
who privately purchased the outer bur-
ial receptacle will be paid the mone-
tary allowance. For burials during the 
period October 9, 1996 through Decem-
ber 31, 1999, the allowance will be paid 
to the person identified as the next of 
kin in records contained in the Na-
tional Cemetery Administration Burial 
Operations Support System based on 
the presumption that such person pri-
vately purchased the outer burial re-
ceptacle (however, if a person who is 
not listed as the next of kin provides 
evidence that he or she privately pur-
chased the outer burial receptacle, the 
allowance will be paid instead to that 
person). No application is required to 
receive payment of a monetary allow-
ance. 

(e) Amount of the allowance. (1) For 
calendar year 2000 and each calendar 
year thereafter, the allowance will be 
the average cost, as determined by VA, 
of Government-furnished graveliners, 
less the administrative costs incurred 
by VA in processing and paying the al-
lowance. 

(i) The average cost of Government-
furnished graveliners will be based 
upon the actual average cost to the 
Government of such graveliners during 
the most recent fiscal year ending 
prior to the start of the calendar year 
for which the amount of the allowance 
will be used. This average cost will be 
determined by taking VA’s total cost 
during that fiscal year for single-depth 
graveliners which were procured for 
placement at the time of interment 
and dividing it by the total number of 
such graveliners procured by VA dur-
ing that fiscal year. The calculation 
shall exclude both graveliners procured 
and pre-placed in gravesites as part of 
cemetery gravesite development 
projects and all double-depth 
graveliners. 

(ii) The administrative costs incurred 
by VA will consist of those costs that 
relate to processing and paying an al-
lowance, as determined by VA, for the 
calendar year ending prior to the start 

of the calendar year for which the 
amount of the allowance will be used. 

(2) For calendar year 2000 and each 
calendar year thereafter, the amount 
of the allowance for each calendar year 
will be published in the ‘‘Notices’’ sec-
tion of the FEDERAL REGISTER. The 
FEDERAL REGISTER Notice will also 
provide, as information, the deter-
mined average cost of Government-fur-
nished graveliners and the determined 
amount of the administrative costs to 
be deducted. 

(3) The published allowance amount 
for interments which occur during cal-
endar year 2000 will also be used for 
payment of any allowances for inter-
ments which occurred during the pe-
riod from October 9, 1996 through De-
cember 31, 1999. 

(Authority: 38 U.S.C. 2306(d)) 

[65 FR 76937, Dec. 8, 2000]

§ 1.630 Headstones and markers. 

(a) Types of Government headstones 
and markers and inscriptions will be in 
accordance with policies approved by 
the Secretary. 

(b) Inscriptions on Government 
headstones, markers, and private 
monuments will be in accordance with 
policies and specifications of the Under 
Secretary for Memorial Affairs. 

(c) A memorial headstone or marker 
furnished for a deceased veteran by the 
Government may be erected in a pri-
vate cemetery or in a national ceme-
tery section established for this pur-
pose. The headstones or markers for 
national cemeteries will be of the 
standard design authorized for the 
cemetery in which they are to be erect-
ed. In addition to the authorized in-
scription, the words ‘‘In Memory Of’’ 
are mandatory. 

(Authority: 38 U.S.C. 501) 

[43 FR 26571, June 21, 1978, as amended at 57 
FR 44123, Sept. 24, 1992; 61 FR 27282, May 31, 
1996]

§ 1.631 [Reserved]

§ 1.632 Headstone and marker applica-
tion required. 

(a) Headstones and markers for 
graves in national cemeteries shall be 
ordered from the Record of Interment 
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